
July
NORTH CAROLINA STATE COLLEGE OF Professor Seitsinger works closely with 
CEAT Dean Paul Tikalsky on matters 
related to academic outcomes, staf�ng, 
scheduling, and accreditation.  Randy’s 
prior experience as Head of the School 
of Architecture from 1995-2016 serves 
him well in understanding the workings of 
the university and anticipating the needs 
of units in the College.  As Head and a 
Professor in the School of Architecture, 
Randy participated in the summer 
European Studies program often and as 
a design studio critic and juror whenever 
possible, in addition to his administrative 
duties.  Randy was responsible for 
securing the Donald W Reynolds 
Foundation grant that made the renovation 
and addition to the Architecture Building 
possible; the project received an AIA 
Oklahoma Honor Award for its design 
in 2012.  Because of his longstanding 
involvement in architectural education and 
for service to the AIA in Oklahoma,                              

Randy was elevated to FAIA in 2015.

UNIVERSITY OF NEBRASKA-LINCOLN

July 17, 2017

The College of Architecture from the 
University of Nebraska-Lincoln (UNL) is 
pleased to announce Associate Professor 
Timothy Hemsath and architectural 
doctoral candidate Kaveh Alagheh 
Bandhosseini have published through 
Routledge an insightful, research-driven 
book packed with hundreds of simulated 
illustrations entitled “Energy Modeling in 
Architectural Design”.

This ground-breaking book provides the 
reader with detailed energy-saving, design 
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https://www.studyarchitecture.com/school/north-carolina-state-university/
https://www.studyarchitecture.com/school/north-carolina-state-university/
https://www.studyarchitecture.com/school/oklahoma-state-university/
https://www.studyarchitecture.com/school/university-of-nebraska-lincoln/
http://www.acsa-arch.org/acsa-news/submit 
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